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Ephesians 1:22·· He also subjected all things under his feet, and made him 
head over all things to the congregation. 

 [8] - References: 

· You make him dominate over the works of your hands, 
everything you have put under his feet. (Psalms 8:6) 

· And Jesus approached and spoke to them, saying;  All authority 
has been given me in heaven and on the earth. (Matthew 28:18) 

· Because a husband is head of his wife as the Christ also is head 
of the congregation, he being a savior of this body. (Ephesians 
5:23) 

· And he is the head of the body, the congregation.  He is the 
beginning, the firstborn from the dead, that he might become the 
one who is first in all things. (Colossians 1:18) 

· And to him there were given rulership and dignity and kingdom, 
that the peoples, national groups and languages should all serve 
even him.  His rulership is an indefinitely lasting rulership that 
will not pass away, and his kingdom one that will not be brought 
to ruin. (Daniel 7:14) 

· For God, subjected all things under his feet.  But when he says 
that ‘all things have been subjected, it is evident that it is with 
the exception of the one who subjected all things to him. (1 
Corinthians 15:27) 

· Whereas he is not holding fast to the head, to the one from 
whom all the body, being supplied and harmoniously joined 
together by means of its joints and ligaments, goes on growing 
with the growth that God gives. (Colossians 2:19) 

· All things you subjected under his feet.  For in that he subjected 
all things to him God left nothing that is not subject to him.  
Now, though, we do not yet see all things in subjection to him. 
(Hebrews 2:8) 

 


